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8600

[Three unidentified men using a machine to make hay. One man is sitting on a 
wagon filled with hay while the others work the machine. In the distance is a fourth 
man loading what appears to be a stove, boiler, or steam engine.] -- n.d..

Agriculture

8601

[Constable G.I. Cameron, Mrs. Martha Cameron, and their daughter Ione Cameron. 
Mr. Cameron is dressed in the R.C.M.P uniform. They are standing near a wire 

fence with a cabin in the background.] -- ca. 1930s.

Cameron, G.I.

Cameron, Ione

Cameron, Martha

Portrait

8602

[l-r: May Menzies, Austin Menzies, Joyce Menzies, and Joe Menzies. They are in a 
temporary camp set up in the Selwyn Hills during a flood. Mr. Menzies is pointing a 
rifle.] -- ca. 1936.

Camp

Menzies, Austin

Menzies, Joe

Menzies, Joyce

Menzies, May

8603

[A small herd of caribou fording a river. Only their heads are visible above the 
water.] -- ca. 1930s.

Caribou

8604

[Five unidentified children with sleds and dogs. Several buildings are in the 
background.] -- ca. 1930s.

Children

Leisure

8605

[A group of five children standing on the bank of a river. The two small children in 
front are Austin Menzies (l) and Joyce Menzies. They are all dressed in summer 
clothes including shorts.] -- ca. 1934.

Children

Menzies, Austin

Menzies, Joyce

8606

[Summer portrait of May Menzies with her two children Joyce Menzies (l) and Austin 
Menzies (r) in Dawson City, Yukon. They are standing on a boardwalk with houses 
and telephone poles in the background.] -- ca. 1934.

Dawson City - Leisure

Children

Dawson City - Street Scene

Leisure - Dawson City

Menzies, Austin

Menzies, Joyce

Menzies, May
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8607

[View from the boardwalk outside St. Paul's Hostel in summer in Dawson City, 
Yukon. A group of First Nations children are standing and sitting near a flower 
garden in the side yard.] -- ca. 1930s.

Dawson City - Residence

Dawson City - Street Scene

8608

[A large group of people standing on a dock at Dawson City, Yukon. Several barges 
with goods are tied up nearby and large warehouses are visible. ] -- ca. 1930s.

Dawson City - Riverfront scene

8609

[Summer view of five dogs standing with their front paws draped over the top rail of 
their kennel at Coffee Creek, Yukon. Cabin wall in the background.] -- ca. 1930s.

Dogs

8610

[Joyce Menzies (on dog) and Austin Menzies with Constable Henry's dog. Both 
children are wearing snowsuits, knitted hats, scarves, and mukluks.] -- ca. 1934.

Fort Selkirk - Leisure

Children

Leisure - Fort Selkirk

Menzies, Austin

Menzies, Joyce

8611

[Two children, Austin Menzies and Joyce Menzies (in wagon), by a still frozen river. 
Both are wearing spring clothing and hats.] -- ca. 1934.

Fort Selkirk - Leisure

Children

Leisure - Fort Selkirk

Menzies, Austin

Menzies, Joyce

Transportation - Wagon

8612

[Austin Menzies, grinning, poses on his tricycle on the bank of the Yukon River at 
Fort Selkirk, Yukon. He is wearing knickers, high socks, and good shoes.] -- ca. 

Fort Selkirk - Leisure

Children

Leisure - Fort Selkirk

Menzies, Austin

Transportation - Tricycle

8613

[The cemetery at Fort Selkirk, Yukon. Crosses, monuments, and protecting fences 
are visible.] -- n.d..

Fort Selkirk - Cemetery

8614

[The cemetery at Fort Selkirk, Yukon. Monuments, crosses, and protecting fences 
are clearly shown.] -- n.d..

Fort Selkirk - Cemetery
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8615

[A group of parishioners, predominantly First Nations, outside of the new St. 
Andrew's Anglican Church at Fort Selkirk, Yukon.] -- ca. 1930s.

Fort Selkirk - Churches - New St. Andrew's Anglican

Churches - Fort Selkirk - New. St. Andrew's Anglican

8616

[May Menzies standing in a field behind the old St. Andrew's Anglican Church at Fort 
Selkirk, Yukon. An unidentified man is standing beside her. Several other buildings 
are visible.] -- ca. 1930s.

Fort Selkirk - Churches - St. Andrew's Anglican

Churches - Fort Selkirk - St. Andrew's Anglican

Menzies, May

8617

[Joe Menzies and May Menzies standing with their dog on the bank of the Yukon 
River at Fort Selkirk, Yukon. Mr. Menzies is holding a rifle and pipe. Mrs. Menzies 
has a hat in one hand.] -- ca. 1930s.

Fort Selkirk - Leisure

Leisure - Fort Selkirk

Menzies, Joe

Menzies, May

8618

[Young Austin Menzies snowshoeing. Buildings, fencing, flagpole, and what seems 
to be a bell-tower in the background. ] -- ca. 1935.

Fort Selkirk - Leisure

Children

Leisure - Fort Selkirk

Menzies, Austin

Snowshoes

8619

[Two children, Joyce Menzies and Austin Menzies, with a dog identified as 'Whitey' 
in a field at Fort Selkirk, Yukon. Several buildings are in the background.] -- ca. 1935.

Fort Selkirk - Leisure

Children

Dogs

Menzies, Austin

Menzies, Joyce

8620

[May Menzies holding her baby boy, Austin Menzies. She is standing by a woodpile 
with several log buildings in the background.] -- ca. 1929.

Fort Selkirk - Residents

Menzies, Austin

Menzies, May
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8621

[Two children standing in front of two women with cabins in the background. Back: 
Leta (l) and Mary (r) Brown. Front: Abe (l) and Johnny (r) [Brown].] -- ca. 1930s.

Fort Selkirk - Residents

Brown, Abe

Brown, Johnny

Brown, Leta

Brown, Mary

8622

[Joe Menzies standing beside a horse identified as 'Dick' at Fort Selkirk, Yukon. 
Partially melted snow is covering the ground and several cabins are visible. ] -- ca. 
1930s.

Fort Selkirk - Residents

Leisure

Menzies, Joe

8623

[May Menzies standing beside a biplane at Fort Selkirk, Yukon. Written on the side 
of the biplane is 'Martha' and 'Klondike Airways Limited Whitehorse'.]
[Additional info from Yukon aviation historian Bob Cameron 2003: Aircraft is the 
Klondike Airways DeHavilland DH 60X Cirrus Moth 'G-CAUM', aka the "Rilla Martha", 

operated out of Mayo by the Treadwell Yukon Mining company. c. 1930] -- [ca. 1930].

Fort Selkirk - Residents

Airplane - 'Martha'

Menzies, May

8624

[Joyce Menzies sitting in a highchair outside the Menzies home in Fort Selkirk, 
Yukon.] -- ca. 1932.

Fort Selkirk - Residents

Children

Menzies, Joyce

8625

[A small child, Joyce Menzies, sitting in a swing above a boardwalk. She is wearing 
a large sweater, leather booties, and a bonnet.] -- ca. 1933.

Fort Selkirk - Residents

Children

Menzies, Joyce

8626

[A young boy, Austin Menzies, standing near the doorway of a cabin with a small 
bag in one hand. Other buildings are in the distance.] -- ca. 1935.

Fort Selkirk - Residents

Children

Menzies, Austin

8627

[A group of people gathered on the bank of the river at Fort Selkirk, Yukon. They are 
probably waiting for a sternwheeler to arrive. Many buildings are visible, including 
the Taylor & Drury Ltd. General Store. L to R: Coward Cabin, R.C.M.P Detachment, 
Devore Cabin, Devore Shed, T&D Store and School.] -- ca. 1930s.

Fort Selkirk - Riverfront Scene

Fort Selkirk - Taylor & Drury Post
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8628

[The Taylor & Drury Store in summer at Fort Selkirk, Yukon. The low attached 
building is the fur/store room. Other log buildings are also visible.] -- n.d..

Fort Selkirk - Taylor & Drury Post

Taylor & Drury Post - Fort Selkirk

8629

[Three unidentified men plowing a field using a dog team. A windmill and several 
large farm buildings are in the distance.] -- ca. 1918.

Hay River, N.W.T.

Agriculture

Dog team

8630

[Joe Menzies (center, sitting) poses with six unidentified men in front of a cabin. The 
four men standing are supposedly millionaires, while the men in the front row are 

their guides. Original photograph damaged.] -- 13 Sep 1920.

Hunting Party 

Menzies, Joe

8631

[First Nations beadwork and quillwork on moosehide, velvet, and flannel, including: 
leggings, pouches, arm bands, and a pipe holder. Most with floral designs. All were 
brought back to the Yukon from the N.W.T. by May Menzies in 1918.] -- 1978.

Bruce BatchelorFirst Nations - Crafts

8632

[First Nations beadwork and quillwork on moosehide and velvet, including: 

headband, pillow slip, baby strap, moccasins, picture frame, and book cover. All 
were brought back to the Yukon from the N.W.T. by May Menzies in 1918.] -- 1978.

Bruce BatchelorFirst Nations - Crafts

8633

[First Nations beadwork and embroidery on moosehide and velvet, including: three 
dolls in velvet 'moss' bags and a round moosehide wall hanging. All were brought 
back to the Yukon from the N.W.T. by May Menzies in 1918.] -- 1978.

Bruce BatchelorFirst Nations - Crafts

8634

[First Nations beadwork on moosehide, including: table cover with fringes, two cloth 
dolls, and two caribou parka dolls. All were brought back to the Yukon from the 

N.W.T. by May Menzies in 1918.] -- 1978.

Bruce BatchelorFirst Nations - Crafts

8635

[First Nations beadwork, quillwork, and embroidery on moosehide, including: 
mukluks, pouches, slippers, knitted cuffs, and a toy toboggan. All were brought back 
to the Yukon from the N.W.T. by May Menzies in 1918.] -- 1978.

Bruce BatchelorFirst Nations - Crafts

8636

[First Nations clothing modelled by May Menzies' granddaughter, including: leggings, 
skirts, and mukluks. All were brought back to the Yukon from the N.W.T. by May 
Menzies in 1918.] -- 1978.

Bruce BatchelorFirst Nations - Crafts
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8637

[May Menzies' granddaughter modelling First Nations leggings, mukluks, skirts, and 
a headband. All were brought back to the Yukon from the N.W.T. by May Menzies in 
1918.] -- 1978.

Bruce BatchelorFirst Nations - Crafts

8638

[May Menzies' granddaughter modelling a First Nations blanket and 'baby strap' with 
a doll on her back. All were brought back to the Yukon from the N.W.T. by May 

Menzies in 1918.] -- 1978.

Bruce BatchelorFirst Nations - Crafts

8639

[Joe Menzies and May Menzies in their boat leaving Isaac Creek, Yukon. An 
unidentified man is standing on shore. Mr. Menzies is poling the boat away from 
shore. Just visible are their children, Austin Menzies and Joyce Menzies.] -- ca. 1935.

Isaac Creek - Leisure

Menzies, Austin

Menzies, Joe

Menzies, Joyce

Menzies, May

River Travel

8640

[May Menzies posing in front of Le Drooks cabins at Kirkman Creek, Yukon. Sheep 
are milling about in the yard. An old wheelbarrow is in the background.] -- ca. 1930s.

Kirkman Creek - Leisure

Kirkman Creek - Cabins

Leisure - Kirkman Creek Area

Menzies, May

Sheep Herding - Kirkman Creek Area

8641

[Austin Menzies standing in tall grass and holding a model of a biplane in one hand. 
He is wearing knickers and high socks.] -- ca. 1930s.

Menzies, Austin

Children

8642

[Austin Menzies standing in a garden holding a large ball. He is wearing shorts and 
ankle high shoes. There is a woodpile in the background.] -- ca. 1934.

Menzies, Austin

Children

8643

[Austin Menzies (r) and Joyce Menzies sitting on a small snow covered boat petting 
two squirrels. A dog is under the boat which is up on sawhorses.] -- ca. 1936.

Menzies, Austin

Children

Leisure

Menzies, Joyce
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8644

[Joe Menzies standing beside his dog team in summer. The dogs are harnessed to a 
wagon loaded with cut lumber for Scofield's store at Fort Selkirk, Yukon. ] -- ca. 1920.

Menzies, Joe

Dog team

Lumber

8645

[Joe Menzies cooking dinner on the bank of the Yukon River. He is holding a skillet 
and there is the Menzies' boat 'Teddy' tied up to shore. Caribou meat is spread out 
in the boat.] -- ca. 1930s.

Menzies, Joe

River Travel

8646

[Joe Menzies standing behind an 80 - point caribou rack. Mr. Menzies is wearing a 
wide-brimmed hat and is holding the antlers at the tips.] -- ca. 1930s.

Bishop Isaac O. 
Stringer

Menzies, Joe

8647

[Joe Menzies standing on a road with fencing and dilapidated buildings in the 
background.] -- ca. 1930s.

Jared WilkinsonMenzies, Joe

8648

[Joe Menzies and May Menzies posing near a wood fence by a cabin. She is 
wearing a dress and light coat. He is dressed in work clothes and cap.] -- ca. 1930s.

Menzies, Joe

Menzies, May

8649

[Joe Menzies standing in a field holding a large waterfowl by the neck. His young 
daughter, Joyce Menzies, is holding on to one wingtip. Several buildings are in the 
background.] -- ca. 1933.

Menzies, Joe

Menzies, Joyce

8650

[Joe Menzies with a dog team harnessed to a long narrow toboggan with a high front 
and back. A basket made of canvas and rope is slung between the two ends of the 
toboggan.] -- ca. 1935.

Menzies, Joe

Dog team

Transportation - Toboggan

8651

[Joe Menzies standing behind six large fish hanging from a pole. Austin Menzies (l) 
and Joyce Menzies are standing to either side.] -- ca. 1936.

Menzies, Joe

Menzies, Austin

Menzies, Joyce

8652

[Joyce Menzies at 2½ years old. She is holding some flowers in one hand and is 
wearing a baggy jumpsuit with rolled up legs. The Yukon River is in the 
background.] -- ca. 1933.

Menzies, Joyce

Children
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8653

[A little girl, Joyce Menzies, standing in front of several small trees holding a doll in 
her arms. She is wearing a white dress, socks, and dress shoes.] -- ca. 1934.

Menzies, Joyce

Children

8654

[Two children, Joyce Menzies and Austin Menzies, standing near the corner of a 
cabin. Austin is holding a toy dump truck. ] -- ca. 1936.

Menzies, Joyce

Children

Menzies, Austin

8655

[Four young girls posing outside with coats and hats on. L-R: unidentified; Joyce 
Menzies; unidentified; Barbara Wasson.] -- 1939.

Menzies, Joyce

Children

Wasson, Barbara

8656

[The wedding party at Joe Menzies and May Austin's wedding. They are standing in 
a small clearing. L-R: Mr. and Mrs. C.F. Johnson; Miss Jean McCarter; Mrs. and Mr. 
Menzies; unidentified.] -- 5 Jul 1928.

Menzies, May

Johnson, Mr. C.F.

Johnson, Mrs. C.F.

McCarter, Jean

Menzies, Joe

8657

[May Menzies sitting on the bow of the boat 'Teddy' which is tied up at shore. There 
is a dog laying beside her. There is a canopy over the back of the boat, and it is 
loaded with several plants, and what appears to be covered furniture. Original 

caption was "honeymoon trip to Selwyn".] -- ca. 1928.

Menzies, May

River Travel

8658

[L-R: May Menzies; Mrs. Whittaker (church worker); and Mrs. Anthony (holding a 
camera) of Fort Yukon. They are posing on a boardwalk. Telephone poles and 
buildings are in the background.] -- ca. 1930s.

Menzies, May

Anthony, Mrs.

Portrait

Whittaker, Mrs.

8659

[May Menzies standing beside Reverend A.C. McCullum at Moosehide, Yukon. Both 
are holding cameras.] -- ca. 1930s.

Menzies, May

McCullum, A.C.

Photographer
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8660

[May Menzies (sitting on blanket) with her son Austin Menzies (on box), sister Grace 
Austin (standing), and daughter Joyce Menzies (in baby carriage). They are 

picnicking on the bank of a river. The Menzies' boat 'Teddy' is in the background.] -- 
ca. 1931.

Menzies, May

Austin, Grace

Leisure

Menzies, Austin

Menzies, Joyce

8661

[L-R: Grace Austin (May Menzies' sister); May Menzies (holding daughter Joyce 
Menzies); and Austin Menzies. They are standing outside of a wood frame house. A 

greenhouse is discernable in the background.] -- ca. 1931.

Menzies, May

Austin, Grace

Menzies, Austin

Menzies, Joyce

8662

[May Menzies sitting in a wheelchair.] -- 1978.

Bruce BatchelorMenzies, May

8663

[May Menzies sitting in a wheelchair with her daughter Joyce and sister Grace Austin 

standing behind her.] -- 1978.

Bruce BatchelorMenzies, May

Austin, Grace

Menzies, Joyce

8664

[May Menzies sitting in a wheelchair in front of shelves full of books.] -- 1978.

Bruce BatchelorMenzies, May

8665

[L-R: Mrs. Metcalf, Reverend Henry B. Metcalf, and May Menzies standing in the 
Menzies boat 'Teddy' which is tied up at shore (possibly Fort Selkirk, Yukon).] -- ca. 
1936.

Metcalf, Henry B.

Boat

Menzies, May

Metcalf, Mrs.

River Travel

8666

[A view of Needle Rock in Granite Canyon on the Pelly River, Yukon.] -- ca. 1930s.

Needle Rock

Granite Canyon

Scenic views
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8667

[May Menzies posing in front of Mr. Chapman's house at the Pelly Farm, Yukon. She 
is wearing a dress and hat and is holding a purse. A water tank, valve, and iron 
piping are visible to one side.] -- ca. 1930s.

Pelly Farm - Cabin

Cabin

Menzies, May

8668

[May Menzies gesturing at two goats at Pelly Farm, Yukon. She is wearing a dress 
and hat and is holding a purse. ] -- ca. 1930s.

Pelly Farm - Leisure

Leisure - Pelly Farm

Menzies, May

8669

[May Menzies and Joe Menzies standing in a canoe which is beside their boat 
'Teddy'. Mr. Menzies is holding a long pole while Mrs. Menzies hauls in a fishing 
net.] -- ca. 1930s.

River Travel

Menzies, Joe

Menzies, May

8670

[A frontal exterior view of a large log building. There is a small alcove at the front 
door and an attached storage building on the left side. A ladder is leaning against 
the roof and a cart is visible to one side.] -- ca. 1930s.

Scenic views

Cabin

8671

[Two children, Austin Menzies (l) and Joyce Menzies, playing in the woodpile at the 
Menzies residence in Selwyn River, Yukon. The cabin is partially visible.] -- ca. 1935.

Selwyn River - Leisure

Children

Leisure - Selwyn River

Menzies, Austin

Menzies, Joyce

8672

[A small child, Joyce Menzies, standing with a dog beside her. The dog's paws are 
around Miss Menzies' waist.] -- ca. 1936.

Selwyn River - Leisure

Dogs

Leisure - Selwyn River

Menzies, Joyce
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8673

[Two children, Austin Menzies (l) and Joyce Menzies, posing with two woodcutters 
and a dog at Selwyn River, Yukon. A large woodpile is in the background.] -- ca. 

1936.

Selwyn River - Leisure

Children

Leisure - Selwyn River

Menzies, Austin

Menzies, Joyce

8674

[Two children, Austin Menzies (l) and Joyce Menzies, preparing to take a bath in a 
round tin tub outside during summer.] -- ca. 1936.

Selwyn River - Leisure

Children

Leisure

Menzies, Austin

Menzies, Joyce

8675

[Mrs. Alice Valentine with Joyce Menzies (front) and Austin Menzies (back) on a 
horse identified as 'Dick'.] -- ca. 1936.

Selwyn River - Leisure

Leisure - Selwyn River

Menzies, Austin

Menzies, Joyce

Valentine, Alice

8676

[Joyce Menzies (l) with her dog 'Keno' and Austin Menzies with his dog 'Pinto'. They 

are kneeling in some brush beside a pathway and are wearing overalls. ] -- ca. 1937.

Selwyn River - Leisure

Children

Dogs

Leisure - Selwyn River

Menzies, Austin

Menzies, Joyce

8677

[A small boy, Austin Menzies, poses with a toy pull-along truck. He is standing 
beside some flowers outside the Menzies residence at Selwyn River, Yukon.] -- ca. 
1937.

Selwyn River - Leisure

Children

Menzies, Austin

Selwyn River - Residence - Menzies
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8678

[L-R: Joyce Menzies, Austin Menzies, and Joe Menzies. The two children are 
holding bunches of fresh carrots. In the background is a corral with sacks draped 
over the top rails. ] -- ca. 1937.

Selwyn River - Leisure

Children

Leisure - Selwyn River

Selwyn River - Residents

8679

[Two children, Austin Menzies (l) and Joyce Menzies, in front of the Menzies 
residence at Selwyn River, Yukon.] -- ca. 1934.

Selwyn River - Residence - Menzies

Children

Menzies, Austin

Menzies, Joyce

8680

[Two children, Austin Menzies (l) and Joyce Menzies, standing in the garden of the 
Menzies residence at Selwyn River, Yukon. The cabin and mountains are in the 

background.] -- ca. 1934.

Selwyn River - Residence - Menzies

Children

Gardens

Menzies, Austin

Menzies, Joyce

8681

[Several log cabins at Selwyn River wood camp in summer. On the right is the 
Menzies old cabin and on the left is their new cabin with a barn in the center. ] -- ca. 
1936.

Selwyn River - Residence - Menzies

8682

[The Menzies family in the garden by their residence at Selwyn River, Yukon. L-R: 
Joyce Menzies, May Menzies, Austin Menzies, and Joe Menzies. The sod roof of the 
cabin and two dogs are visible.] -- ca. 1937.

Selwyn River - Residence - Menzies

Menzies, Austin

Menzies, Joe

Menzies, Joyce

Menzies, May

8683

[Lily Baum, a First Nations woman from Selwyn River, posing with two of her children 
in a field of snow. A post wrapped with chains and a toboggan are partially visible.] -- 
ca. 1930s.

Selwyn River - Residents

Baum, Lily

Children
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8684

[Elsie Johnson (née: Baum), with her baby boy, Doug Johnson in her arms, and a 
small boy, Stan Johnson, standing beside her.] -- ca. 1930s.

Selwyn River - Residents

Johnson, Doug

Johnson, Elsie

Johnson, Stan

8685

[The Menzies family on their boat 'Teddy' which is loaded with dead caribou. Visible 
in the back of the boat are l-r: May Menzies, Joyce Menzies, and Joe Menzies, with 
Austin Menzies in the foreground.] -- ca. 1935.

Selwyn River - Residents

Boat

Hunting Party

Menzies, Austin

Menzies, Joe

Menzies, Joyce

Menzies, May

8686

[May Menzies with her children Joyce Menzies (l) and Austin Menzies (r) and their 
dog 'Prince'. The Yukon River is in the background.] -- ca. 1936.

Selwyn River - Residents

Menzies, Austin

Menzies, Joyce

Menzies, May

8687

[Two children, Austin Menzies and Joyce Menzies, holding a set of velvet covered 
caribou antlers. They are standing in front of the first Menzies residence at the 
Selwyn River wood camp.] -- ca. 1936.

Selwyn River - Residents

Children

Menzies, Austin

Menzies, Joyce

Selwyn River - Residence - Menzies

8688

[Two children, Austin Menzies and Joyce Menzies, playing with a small wheelbarrow 
outside the first Menzies residence at Selwyn River wood camp. Shovels, shelves 
with jars, and tin tubs are all visible.] -- ca. 1936.

Selwyn River - Residents

Children

Menzies, Austin

Menzies, Joyce

Selwyn River - Residence - Menzies
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8689

[Joyce Menzies and Austin Menzies with their dog near Selwyn River, Yukon. Austin 
is holding a toy boat.] -- ca. 1936.

Selwyn River - Residents

Children

Menzies, Austin

Menzies, Joyce

8690

[A group of young boys on and around a toboggan on what appears to be a frozen 
river. They are identified as the Baums, a First Nations family at Selwyn River, 
Yukon. Extreme right: Stan Johnson.] -- ca. 1937.

Selwyn River - Residents

Baum Children

Children

Johnson, Stan

8691

[Six Baum children sitting on a toboggan. They are all bundled up and ready for the 
dog to pull them along. Front: Stan Johnson.] -- ca. 1937.

Selwyn River - Residents

Baum Children

Johnson, Stan

8692

[The sternwheeler 'Klondike' tied up at Selwyn River, Yukon. People are loading 

goods via the gangway. Bales of hay and other goods can be seen piled up on 
deck. ] -- ca. 1930s.

Selwyn River - Riverfront Scene

River Travel

Sternwheeler - 'Klondike'

8693

[Several cabins at Selwyn River as flood waters are receding. The water is still 
several feet up the side of the cabins. ] -- ca. 1936.

Selwyn River - Riverfront Scene

Selwyn River - Cabin

8694

[The cabins at Selwyn River after a flood. The ice jam on the river and individual ice 
floes are visible as well as the debris left by the flood.] -- ca. 1936.

Selwyn River - Riverfront Scene

Selwyn River - Cabin

8695

[Joe Menzies (foreground) and others, carrying meat back to the cabins after a flood 
at Selwyn River, Yukon. Debris and ice floes are still visible.] -- ca. 1936.

Selwyn River - Riverfront Scene

Menzies, Joe

Selwyn River - Cabin
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8696

[Joe Menzies stacking cut logs on the river bank for loading onto a sternwheeler. A 
cart loaded with cut wood is nearby.] -- ca. 1937.

Selwyn River - Wood Camp

Menzies, Joe

Selwyn River - Riverfront Scene

Wood Camp

8697

[The sternwheeler 'Aksala' tied up to shore. Several men are working on the 
gangway and on the ship. Other people are watching from the second level of the 
ship.] -- ca. 1930s.

Sternwheeler - 'Aksala'

River Travel

8698

[Reverend William and Mrs. Alice Valentine with the Menzies children, Joyce 
Menzies (l) and Austin Menzies. They are standing in an open field.] -- ca. 1930s.

Valentine, William

Menzies, Austin

Menzies, Joyce

Portrait

Valentine, Alice

8699

[A group portrait of the Van Bibber family. Center is Ira Van Bibber (tall man), his 

wife Eliza Van Bibber (First Nations woman with the scarf around her head), and 10 
of their children. Cabins in the background.] -- ca. 1930s.

Van Bibber, Ira

Portrait

Van Bibber, Eliza

8700

[A group portrait of the Girl Guides during summer. They are posing in a clearing 
among small trees. Back (extreme right): May Menzies; Joyce Menzies (in front of 
May). The tall girl in the back row is also identified as Betty McBride.] -- ca. 1939.

Whitehorse - Girl Guides

Girl Guides

McBride, Betty

Menzies, Joyce

Menzies, May
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8701

[Three young children standing by the open door of the airplane 'CF-BLT' at the 
Whitehorse airport. L-R: Austin Menzies; Joyce Menzies; and Phyllis LePage. The 
two girls are on skis.]

[Additional info from Yukon aviation historian Bob Cameron 2003: The airplane is 
the BYN Co. Bellanca Aircruiser 'CF-BLT', parked in front of the White Pass Hangar 
at the Whitehorse Airport. c. 1939.] -- [ca. 1939].

Whitehorse - Leisure

Airplane - 'CF-BLT'

Leisure - Whitehorse

LePage, Phyllis

Menzies, Austin

Menzies, Joyce

8702

[Back: May Menzies (holding a cat); unidentified. Front: Austin and Joyce Menzies. 
The scene is in front of the Menzies house in Whitehorse, Yukon.] -- ca. 1939.

Whitehorse - Residents

Menzies, Austin

Menzies, Joyce

Menzies, May

Whitehorse - Residence - Menzies

8703

[Front view of the White Pass and Yukon Route locomotive #70 on its side after a 

derailment.] -- ca. 1940.

W.P.&Y.R. - Accident

8704

[An unknown wood camp showing a large stack of wood with a cabin in the 
background. Probably along the Yukon River.] -- n.d..

Wood Camp
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Agriculture

8600

8629

Airplane - 'CF-BLT'

8701

Airplane - 'Martha'

8623

Anthony, Mrs.

8658

Austin, Grace

8660

8661

8663

Baum Children

8690

8691

Baum, Lily

8683

Boat

8665

8685

Brown, Abe

8621

Brown, Johnny

8621

Brown, Leta

8621

Brown, Mary

8621

Cabin

8667

8670

Cameron, G.I.

8601

Cameron, Ione

8601

Cameron, Martha

8601

Camp

8602

Caribou

8603

Children

8604

8605

8606

8610

8611

8612

8618

8619

8624

8625

8626

8641

8642

8643

8652

8653

8654

8655

8671

8673

8674

8676

8677

8678

8679

8680

8683

8687

8688

8689

8690

Churches - Fort Selkirk - New. St. 

Andrew's Anglican

8615

Churches - Fort Selkirk - St. Andrew's 

Anglican

8616
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Dawson City - Leisure

8606

Dawson City - Residence

8607

Dawson City - Riverfront scene

8608

Dawson City - Street Scene

8606

8607

Dog team

8629

8644

8650

Dogs

8609

8619

8672

8676

First Nations - Crafts

8631

8632

8633

8634

8635

8636

8637

8638

Fort Selkirk - Cemetery

8613

8614

Fort Selkirk - Churches - New St. 

Andrew's Anglican

8615

Fort Selkirk - Churches - St. Andrew's 

Anglican

8616

Fort Selkirk - Leisure

8610

8611

8612

8617

8618

8619

Fort Selkirk - Residents

8620

8621

8622

8623

8624

8625

8626

Fort Selkirk - Riverfront Scene

8627

Fort Selkirk - Taylor & Drury Post

8627

8628

Gardens

8680

Girl Guides

8700

Granite Canyon

8666

Hay River, N.W.T.

8629

Hunting Party 

8630

8685

Isaac Creek - Leisure

8639

Johnson, Doug

8684

Johnson, Elsie

8684

Johnson, Mr. C.F.

8656

Johnson, Mrs. C.F.

8656

Johnson, Stan

8684

8690
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8691

Kirkman Creek - Cabins

8640

Kirkman Creek - Leisure

8640

Leisure

8604

8622

8643

8660

8674

Leisure - Dawson City

8606

Leisure - Fort Selkirk

8610

8611

8612

8617

8618

Leisure - Kirkman Creek Area

8640

Leisure - Pelly Farm

8668

Leisure - Selwyn River

8671

8672

8673

8675

8676

8678

Leisure - Whitehorse

8701

LePage, Phyllis

8701

Lumber

8644

McBride, Betty

8700

McCarter, Jean

8656

McCullum, A.C.

8659

Menzies, Austin

8602

8605

8606

8610

8611

8612

8618

8619

8620

8626

8639

8641

8642

8643

8651

8654

8660

8661

8671

8673

8674

8675

8676

8677

8679

8680

8682

8685

8686

8687

8688

8689

8698

8701

8702

Menzies, Joe

8602
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8617

8622

8630

8639

8644

8645

8646

8647

8648

8649

8650

8651

8656

8669

8682

8685

8695

8696

Menzies, Joyce

8602

8605

8606

8610

8611

8619

8624

8625

8639

8643

8649

8651

8652

8653

8654

8655

8660

8661

8663

8671

8672

8673

8674

8675

8676

8679

8680

8682

8685

8686

8687

8688

8689

8698

8700

8701

8702

Menzies, May

8602

8606

8616

8617

8620

8623

8639

8640

8648

8656

8657

8658

8659

8660

8661

8662

8663

8664

8665

8667

8668

8669

8682

4last modified on:  2019-10-23     status:  Approved



May Menzies fonds

YUKON ARCHIVES PHOTO SUBJECT LIST

YA#Subjects

78/23acc#

8685

8686

8700

8702

Metcalf, Henry B.

8665

Metcalf, Mrs.

8665

Needle Rock

8666

Pelly Farm - Cabin

8667

Pelly Farm - Leisure

8668

Photographer

8659

Portrait

8601

8658

8698

8699

River Travel

8639

8645

8657

8665

8669

8692

8697

Scenic views

8666

8670

Selwyn River - Cabin

8693

8694

8695

Selwyn River - Leisure

8671

8672

8673

8674

8675

8676

8677

8678

Selwyn River - Residence - Menzies

8677

8679

8680

8681

8682

8687

8688

Selwyn River - Residents

8678

8683

8684

8685

8686

8687

8688

8689

8690

8691

Selwyn River - Riverfront Scene

8692

8693

8694

8695

8696

Selwyn River - Wood Camp

8696

Sheep Herding - Kirkman Creek Area

8640

Snowshoes

8618

Sternwheeler - 'Aksala'

8697

Sternwheeler - 'Klondike'

8692
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Taylor & Drury Post - Fort Selkirk

8628

Transportation - Toboggan

8650

Transportation - Tricycle

8612

Transportation - Wagon

8611

Valentine, Alice

8675

8698

Valentine, William

8698

Van Bibber, Eliza

8699

Van Bibber, Ira

8699

W.P.&Y.R. - Accident

8703

Wasson, Barbara

8655

Whitehorse - Girl Guides

8700

Whitehorse - Leisure

8701

Whitehorse - Residence - Menzies

8702

Whitehorse - Residents

8702

Whittaker, Mrs.

8658

Wood Camp

8696

8704
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